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Date 25th April 2018 
 
 
Email:  
 
Dear 
 
I am writing in response to your enquiry under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) 
reference FOI/17/11/30. 
 
You requested the following information, please also see our response below: 
 
1) How much have you spent in £, in the business years 2007, 2008, 2009, 2010, 2012, 2013, 
2014, 2015 and 2016 on: 
a) Medical and training equipment (medical equipment, pharmaceuticals, training- & 
education equipment, bags, splintage immobilisation equipment, disposables, monitors and 
defibrillators, ventilatores etc.) 
Please see table below. Unfortunately, we do not hold information for 2007 
 

Year Total Spend 

2008 £4,121,912 

2009 £3,023,645 

2010 £5,417,211 

2011 £3,627,344 

2012 £4,158,495 

2013 £4,236,046 

2014 £4,736,289 

2015 £5,614,831 

2016 £5,320,825 

 
b) Externally commissioned teaching and training 
Please see table below. Unfortunately, we do not hold information for 2007 
 

Year Total Spend 

2008 £391,448 

2009 £790,526 

2010 £342,826 

2011 £340,905 

2012 £432,722 

2013 £310,946 

2014 £493,390 

2015 £253,715 
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2016 £348,977 

 
2) How much of the above products (in £)  have been commissioned from or through the 
company Prometheus Medical Ltd (located in Hope-under-Dinmore Herefordshire HR60PW 
and London EC1Y8LP) during the corresponding business years. 
Please see table below. Unfortunately, we do not hold information for 2007 
 

Year Total Spend 

2008 Nil 

2009 Nil 

2010 £23,209 

2011 £8,108 

2012 £27,455 

2013 £14,013 

2014 £68,496 

2015 £226,918 

2016 £165,918 

 
 
I hope you find this information of some assistance. 
 
If for any reason you are dissatisfied with our response, kindly in the first instance contact Caroline 
Smart, Information Governance Manager via the following email address: 
 
FOI@secamb.nhs.uk 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Freedom of Information Coordinator 
South East Coast Ambulance Service NHS Foundation Trust 
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